
Hoopidity.com Privacy Policy  

Effective Date: 11/5/24 

  

At Hoopidity.com, we value your privacy and are committed to protecting 
your personal information. This Privacy Policy explains how we collect, use, 
and protect your information when you visit our website and interact with 
our services. 

  

1. Information We Collect 

When you visit **www.hoopidity.com**, we may collect the following types 
of information: 

 

Personal Information:  

If you voluntarily provide us with information, such as when you contact us 
or sign up for our newsletter, we may collect your name, email address, and 
other relevant details. 

Non-Personal Information: We may collect non-identifiable information 
automatically as you interact with our website, such as IP addresses, 
browser type, and browsing patterns. This data helps us improve our 
website and services. 

  

2. How We Use Your Information 

We use the information we collect to: 

  

- Provide and improve our website and services 

- Respond to your inquiries and feedback 



- Send you important updates, if you have opted-in to receive 
communications 

Monitor website performance and troubleshoot issues 

  

3. Do We Share Your Information? 

No, we do not sell, rent, or share your personal information with third 
parties. Your privacy is important to us, and we will never share your 
information with other companies for marketing purposes. 

  

We may share information with trusted service providers who assist us in 
operating the website and providing services to you. These third-party 
providers are required to protect your information and use it solely for the 
services they provide to us. 

  

4. Data Security 

We take reasonable steps to protect your personal information from 
unauthorized access, use, or disclosure. However, no method of internet 
transmission or electronic storage is 100% secure, and we cannot guarantee 
complete security. 

  

5. Cookies 

Our website may use cookies to enhance your browsing experience. Cookies 
are small files placed on your device that help us improve functionality and 
track website usage. You can control cookie settings through your browser, 
but disabling cookies may affect your ability to use some features of our 
website. 

  

6. Third-Party Links 



Our website may contain links to third-party websites. Please note that we 
are not responsible for the privacy practices or content of these external 
sites. We encourage you to review their privacy policies before providing any 
personal information. 

  

7. Your Rights 

You have the right to: 

  

- Access, update, or delete your personal information 

- Opt-out of any communications you no longer wish to receive 

  

To exercise these rights, please contact us at brandy@hoopidity.com. 

  

8. Changes to This Privacy Policy 

We may update this Privacy Policy from time to time. Any changes will be 
posted on this page, and the updated policy will be effective as of the 
"Effective Date" at the top of this page. 

  

9. Contact Us 

If you have any questions or concerns about this Privacy Policy or how we 
handle your information, please contact us at: 

  

Hoopidity.com  

Email: brandy@hoopidity.com  

Website: www.hoopidity.com 

 


